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Medium Industrial Service 

Schedule MI 

 

Availability 

 

Available only to establishments classified as “Manufacturing Industries” by the Standard Industrial 
Classification Manual, 1957 or later version, published by the Bureau of Budget, United States 
Government, and where more than 50% of the electric consumption of such establishment is used for its 
manufacturing processes whose monthly demand exceeds 50 kW in any three months of the preceding 
twelve months but is less than 250 kW. 
 
Service under this Schedule shall be used solely by the contracting Customer in a single enterprise, 
located entirely on a single site. 
 
This Schedule is not available for auxiliary or breakdown service.  Power delivered under this Schedule 
shall not be used for resale or exchange or in parallel with other electric power, or as a substitute for 
power contracted for or which may be contracted for, under any other schedule of the City, except at the 
option of the City, under special terms and conditions expressed in writing with the contract with the 
Customer. 
 
Type of Service 

 
The City will furnish 60-Hertz service through one meter, at one delivery point, at the available voltage. 
  
The type of service supplied will depend upon the voltage available.  Prospective customers should 
determine the available voltage by contacting the City before purchasing equipment. 
 
Motors less than 5 H.P. may be single-phase.  All motors of more than 5 H.P. must be equipped with 
starting compensators and all motors of more than 25 H.P. must be the slip ring type except that the City 
reserves the right, when in its opinion the installation would not be detrimental to the service of the City, 
to permit other types of motors. 

                    For Billing Months Energy Rates 

Basic Facilities Charge $145.00 

Minimum Charge: Basic Facilities Charge 

Demand Charge:  

    All kW $12.00 per kW 

Energy Charge:  

First 100 kWh per kW Billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0645 per kWh 

Next 200 kWh per kW billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0626 per kWh 

All Over 300 kWh per kW Billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0603 per kWh 
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Medium Industrial Service 

Schedule MI 
 

 

Determination of Billing Demand 

 
At its option, the City may install a demand meter to measure demand for any customer served under 
this schedule. 
 
The demand for billing purposes each month shall be the maximum integrated 30-minute demand 
measured during the month. 
 
Minimum Bill 

 
The minimum bill shall be the basic facilities charge. 
 
Power Factor Correction 

 

When the average monthly power factor of the Customer’s power requirements is less than 90 percent, 
the City may correct the integrated demand in kilowatts for that month by multiplying by 90 percent and 
dividing the resultant value by the average power factor in percent for that month. 
 
Contract Period 

 
Customers must remain on this Tariff schedule for a period of no less than 12 months before switching 
tariffs or service unless it is determined by the City that the customer no longer qualifies for this service. 
 
The definitions of “Month,” “Determination of Energy,” and “Sales Tax” are contained within the 
General Terms and Conditions and are pertinent to this rate schedule.   The General Terms and 
Conditions Section and the Lexington Utilities Customer Service Policy Manual are an integral part of 
this tariff.  
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Large Industrial Service 

Schedule LI 

 

Availability 

 

Available only to establishments classified as “Manufacturing Industries” by the Standard Industrial 
Classification Manual, 1957 or later version, published by the Bureau of Budget, United States 
Government, and where more than 50% of the electric consumption of such establishment is used for its 
manufacturing processes whose monthly demand exceeds 250 kW in any three months of the preceding 
twelve months but is less than 1,000 kW.  
 
Service under this Schedule shall be used solely by the contracting Customer in a single enterprise, 
located entirely on a single site. 
 
This Schedule is not available for auxiliary or breakdown service.  Power delivered under this Schedule 
shall not be used for resale or exchange or in parallel with other electric power, or as a substitute for 
power contracted for or which may be contracted for, under any other schedule of the City, except at the 
option of the City, under special terms and conditions expressed in writing with the contract with the 
Customer. 
 
Type of Service 

 

The City will furnish 60-Hertz service through one meter, at one delivery point, at the available voltage.  
The type of service supplied will depend upon the voltage available.  Prospective customers should 
determine the available voltage by contacting the City before purchasing equipment. 
 
Motors less than 5 H.P. may be single-phase.  All motors of more than 5 H.P. must be equipped with 
starting compensators and all motors of more than 25 H.P. must be the slip ring type except that the City 
reserves the right, when in its opinion the installation would not be detrimental to the service of the City, 
to permit other types of motors. 
 

                    For Billing Months Energy Rates 

Basic Facilities Charge $430.00 

Minimum Charge: Basic Facilities Charge 

Demand Charge:  

    All kW $12.00 per kW 

Energy Charge:  

First 100 kWh per kW Billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0660 per kWh 

Next 200 kWh per kW billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0615 per kWh 

All Over 300 kWh per kW Billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0598 per kWh 
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Large Industrial Service 

Schedule LI 

 

 
Determination of Billing Demand 

 

At its option, the City may install a demand meter to measure demand for any customer served under 
this schedule. 
 
The demand for billing purposes each month shall be the maximum integrated 30-minute demand 
measured during the month. 
 
Minimum Bill 

 

The minimum bill shall be the basic facilities charge. 
 
Power Factor Correction 

 
When the average monthly power factor of the Customer’s power requirements is less than 90 percent, 
the City may correct the integrated demand in kilowatts for that month by multiplying by 90 percent and 
dividing the resultant value by the average power factor in percent for that month. 
 
Contract Period 

 

Customers must remain on this Tariff schedule for a period of no less than 12 months before switching 
tariffs or service unless it is determined by the City that the customer no longer qualifies for this service. 
                        
The definitions of “Month,” “Determination of Energy,” and “Sales Tax” are contained within the 
General Terms and Conditions and are pertinent to this rate schedule.   The General Terms and 
Conditions Section and the Lexington Utilities Customer Service Policy Manual are an integral part of 
this tariff.  
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Very Large Industrial Service 

Schedule VLI 

 

Availability 

 

Available only to establishments classified as “Manufacturing Industries” by the Standard Industrial 
Classification Manual, 1957 or later version, published by the Bureau of Budget, United States 
Government, and where more than 50% of the electric consumption of such establishment is used for its 
manufacturing processes whose monthly demand is 1,000 kW or greater in any three months of the 
preceding twelve months. 
 
Service under this Schedule shall be used solely by the contracting Customer in a single enterprise, 
located entirely on a single site. 
 
This Schedule is not available for auxiliary or breakdown service.  Power delivered under this Schedule 
shall not be used for resale or exchange or in parallel with other electric power, or as a substitute for 
power contracted for or which may be contracted for, under any other schedule of the City, except at the 
option of the City, under special terms and conditions expressed in writing with the contract with the 
Customer. 
 
Type of Service 

 

The City will furnish 60-Hertz service through one meter, at one delivery point, at the available voltage.  
The type of service supplied will depend upon the voltage available.  Prospective customers should 
determine the available voltage by contacting the City before purchasing equipment. 
 
Motors less than 5 H.P. may be single-phase.  All motors of more than 5 H.P. must be equipped with 
starting compensators and all motors of more than 25 H.P. must be the slip ring type except that the City 
reserves the right, when in its opinion the installation would not be detrimental to the service of the City, 
to permit other types of motors. 

                    For Billing Months Energy Rates 

Basic Facilities Charge $675.00 

Minimum Charge: Basic Facilities Charge 

Demand Charge:  

    All kW $12.00 per kW 

Energy Charge:  

First 100 kWh per kW Billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0638 per kWh 

Next 200 kWh per kW billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0604 per kWh 

All Over 300 kWh per kW Billing Demand Per Month  

    All kWh $.0570 per kWh 
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Very Large Industrial Service 

Schedule VLI 

 
 
Determination of Billing Demand 

 

At its option, the City may install a demand meter to measure demand for any customer served under 
this schedule. 
 
The demand for billing purposes each month shall be the maximum integrated 30-minute 
demand measured during the month. 
 
Minimum Bill 

 
The minimum bill shall be the basic facilities charge. 
 
Power Factor Correction 

 

When the average monthly power factor of the Customer’s power requirements is less than 90 percent, 
the City may correct the integrated demand in kilowatts for that month by multiplying by 90 percent and 
dividing the resultant value by the average power factor in percent for that month. 
 
Contract Period 

 

Customers must remain on this Tariff schedule for a period of no less than 12 months before switching 
tariffs or service unless it is determined by the City that the customer no longer qualifies for this service. 
                       
The definitions of “Month,” “Determination of Energy,” and “Sales Tax” are contained within the 
General Terms and Conditions and are pertinent to this rate schedule.   The General Terms and 
Conditions Section and the Lexington Utilities Customer Service Policy Manual are an integral part of 
this tariff. 
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